Department of Finance

tchester
Oun y Bureau of Purchase & Supplies
148 Martine Avenue, Room 713
White Plains, NY 10601
(914) 231-1872
www. westchestergov.com
CONTRACT AWARD NOTIFICATION
TITLE: AUTOMOTIVE FLUIDS
CONTRACT NUMBER: RFB-WC-24397  (PREVIOUS RFB-WC-24230)
CONTRACT PERIOD: FEBRUARY 14, 2025 TO AUGUST 13, 2025
DATE OF ISSUE: February 4, 2025
COUNTY DEPARTMENTS: DPW, DEF, PRC, AIRPORT, PARTICIPATING MUNICIPALITIES
SPECIFICATION REFRENCE: As Incorporated In The Invitation for Bids
CONTRACTOR Appears on the attached pages of this Award
INFORMATION:

Address Inguiries To:

County Departments & Vendors

Political Subdivisions

Name: Ladia Montalvo
Title:  Senior Buyer
Phone: 914-231-1174
Fax: 914-231-1546

E-mail: Lgm9@WestchesterCountyNY.gov

Customer Service
SAME

DESCRIPTION

This is an agreement covering Automotive Fluids, effective FEBRUARY 14, 2025 for use by all County

Departments and Participating Municipalities.

County departments may process a DO into the AMS system.




The awarded items and prices are on the following pages and the vendor terms are below:

705995

GRADE A PETROLEUM CORP
Attn: Stephen Clyne

90 East Hawthorne Ave,
Valley Stream, NY 11580
Tel: 516-825-5544

Terms: Net 30

FOB: Destination

Del: 2 days ARO
SCLYNE@GRADEALUBE.COM

728430

LUBENET, LLC

Attn: Leonard Roz

126 Scott Ave

Brooklyn, NY 11237

Tel: 800-403-0011

Terms: N30

FOB: Destination

Del: 3 Days ARO
MRUMORE@DASHMOTTOROIL.COM

741523

PETROCHOICE/MOOQVE, LLC

Attn: Laura Semel

640 Freedom Business Center Drive
King of Prussia, PA 19406

Tel: 267-658-9309

Terms: N30

FOB: Destination

Del: 3 Days
LSEMEL@PETROCHOICE.COM

SMALL BUSINESS VETERAN

738591

RELADYNE NORTHEAST, LLC
Attn: Jay Birbaum

35 Drexel Drive

Bay Shore, NY 11706

Tel: 631-234-8900

Terms: N30

FOB: Destination

Del: 3 Days

CONTRACTORDERS@RELADYNE.COM

982428

SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS, INC

Attn: Scott LaRocca

42 Longwater Drive

Norwell, MA 02061

Tel: 781-490-2346

Terms: n30

FOB: Destination

Del: 3 Days
larocca.scott@murphyswasteoil.com

**PLEASE NOTE: $100.00 MINIMUM ORDER**




RFB-WC-24397
AUTOMOTIVE FLUIDS 01/21/25

SAFETY
COUNTY LINE GRADEA PETROCHOICE| RELADYNE |KLEEN
COMMCODE |ITEM |DESCRIPTION UOM PETRGLEUM | LUBENET NORTHEAST |SYSTEMS
0550000001 |1 WINDSHIELD FLUID GA LLON $18.54/CS
0550000002 |2 OIL DRI BAG $10.49
5500000003 |3 CAR WASH LIQUID GALLON| NO BID NO BID NO BIB NOQ BID |[NO BID
0550000021 |4 FREON 134A CONT $330.00
0550000004 |5 BRAKEFLUID QUART $54.60/CS
0550000005 |6 TRANS FLUID QUART $31.80/CS
0550000006 |7 ANTIFREEZE - LOW SILICATE GALLON| $40.02/CS
0550000014 |8 ANTIFREFZE - DEXCOOL GALLON| $41.70/CS
0550000007 |9 80W90 GEAR OIL DRUM $199.00
0550000008 |10 |GREASE(RED GREASE} DRUM $329.00
0550000030 |11 EP1 GREASE PAIL $89.00
0550000035 |12 |EP2 GREASE PAIL $89.00
0550000009 |13 LUBRICATION -RED GREA SE CRTDG $30.50/CS
0550000023 |14 |WHITELITHIUM TUB TUB NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |NnOBID
0550000024 |15  |STARTINGFLUID CAN $37.44/CS
0550000022 |16 |ANTISHZELUBRICANT BOTTLE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  |[NOBID
0550000028 |17  |DIESEL FUEL CONDITIONER QUART | $60.00/CS
4053900004 |18 |SWIOMOTOR OIL QUART $28.68/CS
4053900002 |19 |10W30 MOTOR OIL QUART $28.68/CS
4053900008 |20 [sW20MOTOR OIL QUART §27.24/CS
4053900010 |21 [15W40 MOTOR OIL QUART $31.08/CS
R-1234YF REFRIGERANT HONEY WELL
0550000034 |22 |SEALED SOLSTICE 10# CAN CAN NO BID NQ BID NO BID NOQ BID |NOBID
OILS IN DRUMS
SAFETY
LINE GRADEA PETROCHOICE| RELADYNE |KLEEN
ITEM |DESCRIPTION UoM PETROLEUM | LUBENET NORTHEAST [SYSTEMS
0350000017 1 AWAG DRUM $290.90
0550000025 2 AW32 DRUM $278.98
0550000032 3 ‘TURBINE 46 DRUM $349.00
055000003 | 4 220 GEAR BOX OIL DRUM $1,052.29
0550000036 5 GEAR BOX O1L MOBILE SHC626 DRUM $2,239.00
4053900003 6 SWI0 DRUM $324.00
4053900001 7 10W30 DRUM $324.00
4053900007 8 SW20 DRUM $324.00
4053900009 9 15W40 DRUM $445.71
405390001 1 10 |10 WEIGHT DRUM $278.98
4053900012 il |20 WHGHT DRUM $319.40
4053900013 12 |40 WEIGHT DRUM $359.00
0550000010 13 |[TRANSMISSION FLUID DRUM $403.55
0550000011 14  |ANTIFREEZE LOW SILICATE DRUM $305.00
0550000015 15 |ANTIFREEZE-DEXCOOL DRUM $275.00
0550000029 16  |ANTIFREEZE UNIVERSAL DRUM $198.00
0550000027 17 |DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF) DRUM $149.44
0550000033 18 [55GAL DRUM 10W30 DIESEL HEA VY DRUM
DUTY ENGINE OIL DRYDENE $448.61
0550000038 19 |ow20, MOTOR OIL, SYNTHERC TANKBULK |GALLON $6.86
0550000039 20 |5W30, MOTOR OIL SYNTHETIC, TANK/BULK |GALLON $6.98
0550000040 21  |WINDSHIELD FLUID DRUM $140.25
AMOBIL $ YNTHETIC OR APPROVED BRAND FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT - NO SUBSTITUTIONS WITHOUT COUNTY APPROVAL
SAFETY
LINE GRADEA PETROCHOICE| RELADYNE |KLEEN
ITEM |DESCRIPTION UOM PETROLEUM | LUBENET NORTHEAST [SYSTEMS
4059000004 [ $W 30 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $670.45
4059000005 2 10W30 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $571.45
4059000001 3 5W20 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $774.95
4059000009 4 OW 20 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $824 45
4059000002 5 OW40 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $1,187.74
4059000006 6 TRANS FLUID FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $859.00
4059000007 7 5W40 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $1,093.00
4059000008 8 15W 40 FULLY SYNTHETIC DRUM $929.11




FLUIDS BY THE CASE

GRADE A PETROLEUM

COMMODITY 0550000006
ANTIFREEZE, ENGINE COOLANT, LOW SILICATE, ETHYLENE GLYCOL BASE,
1 GAL CONTAINERS, {(STRAIGHT) PEAK #FFAOB3 6 GAL/CS

COMMODITY 0550000014
ANTIFREEZE, ENGINE COOLANT, GM DEXCOOL | GAL CONTAINERS, SHELL #9407006021, 6/CS

COMMODITY 0550000028
DIESEL FUEL CONDITIONER, CRC DIESEL FUEL THERAPHY, HOWES #103062 6QTS/CS
LUBENET

COMMODITY 0550000021
FREON 30LB CAN LUBENET #004

COMMODITY 0550000005
TRANSMISSION FLUID, OEM SPECIFIATIONS FOR THE LATEST DEXRON/MERCON RATINGS
12 QUART CONTAINERS. LUBENET #006  12/CS

COMMODITY 0550000007
80W90 GEAR OIL, 120# DRUM, LUBENET #009

COMMODITY 0550000008
LITHIUM BASE CHASSIS LUBRICATION (RED GREASE), NLG12, 120# DRUM, LUBENET #010

COMMODITY 0550000030
EP1 GREASE, 5 GALLON PAIL, LUBENET #011

COMMODITY 0550000035
EP2 GREASE, 5 GALLON PAIL, LUBENET #012

COMMODITY 4053900004
SW30 MOTOR OIL, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY. QUART, HIGH DETERGENT CAPITALE #015, 12/CS

COMMODITY 4053900002
10W30 MOTOR OIL, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY. QUART, HIGH DETERGENT CAPITALE, #016, 12/CS

RELADYNE NORTHEAST

COMMODITY 0550000001
WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID (ANTIFREEZE SOLVENT) | GAL CONTAINER SPLASH #SPLWWP 6/CS

COMMODITY 0550000002
OIL DRI - GREASE AND OIL ABSORBENT, 40LB BAG, OIL-DRI, #ODAPLAQE

COMMODITY 0550000004
BRAKE FLUID, DOT-3, 1-QUART MAG !, #MAG00120, 12/CS

COMMODITY 0550000009
LUBRICATION LITHIUM BASE CHASSIS (RED GREASE) NLGI12, 14 OZ CARTRIDGES,
ALL FLEET #SVCHITEMPH, 10/CS

COMMODITY 0550000024
STARTING FLUID, 11 OZ SPRAY BOTTLE, PRIMEGUARD #583769999PM 1112 12/CS

COMMODITY 4053900008
5W20 MOTOR OIL, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY. QUART. HIGH DETERGENT DURAMAX #SVC5SW20R, 12/CS

COMMODITY 4053900010
15W40 MOTOR OIL, HEAVY DUTY GASOLINE & LIGHT MEDIUM & HEAVY DIESEL ENGINE.
QUART. HIGH DETERGENT, ALL FLEET #SVCI5W40R 12/CS

$40.02/Cs

$41.70/CS

$60.00/CS

$330.00/CAN

$31.80:CS

$199.00/DRUM

$£329.00/DRUM

$89.00/PAIL

$89.00/PAIL

$26.68/CS

$26.68/CS

§18.54/CS

$10.49/BG

$54.60/C3

$30.50/CS

$37.44/CS

$27.24/CS

$31.08/CS



OILS IN DRUMS

GRADE A PETROLEUM

COMMODITY 0550000036
GEAR BOX OIL MOBILE SHC626, SHELL MORLINA # 550042910

COMMODITY 0550000011
ANTIFREEZE / ENGINE COOLANT, LOW SILICATE, ETHYLENE GLYCOL BASE, 55 GALLON DRUM
(STRAIGHT), PEAK FULL FORCE 50/50, #FFABS51

LUBENET

COMMODITY 0550000032
TURBINE 46 OIL, IN 55 GALLON DRUMS, LUBENET #021

COMMODITY 4053900003
OIL, MOTOR, MULTI-GRADED, 5W/30, 55-GAL DRLIM, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY,
HIGH DETERGENT, LUBENET #024

COMMODITY 4053900001
OIL, MOTOR, MULTI-GRADED, 10W/30, 55-GAL DRUM, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY,
HIGH DETERGENT, LUBENET #025

COMMOPDITY 40539000007
OIL MOTOR 5W20, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY, HIGH DETERGENT 55 GAL DRUM MFR LUBENET #026

COMMODITY 4053900013
40 WEIGHT 55 GALLON DRUM, NON- DETERGENT, LUBENET #030

COMMODITY 0550000015

ANTIFREEZE / ENGINE COOLANT, GM DEXCQOOL EQUIVALENT, LOW SILICATE, ETHYLENE
GLYCOL BASE, 55 GALLON DRUMS, MFR. LUBENET #033

PETROCHOICE

COMMODITY 0550000017
HYDRAULIC OIL, AW46, IN 55-GALLON DRUMS, MRF. DYNAPLEX #DYNI10006004939

COMMODITY 0550000025
HYDRAULIC OIL, AW32, IN 55-GALLON DRUMS, MFR. DYNAPLEX #DYN10000004936

COMMODITY 0550000031
220 GEAR BOX OIL, FULL SYNTHETIC,55-GAL DRUM, MFR. DYNAPLEX #DYN10000004881

COMMODITY 4053900009
OIL, MOTOR, MULTI-GRADED, 15W/40, 55-GAL DRUM, HEAVY DUTY GASOLINE & LIGHT,
MEDIUM & HEAVY DUTY DIESEL ENGINES, HIGH DETERGENT. DYNAPLEX #DYNI10000004711

COMMODITY 4053900011
10 WEIGHT 55 GALLON DRUM, NON-DETERGENT, DYNAPLEX #DYN10000004936

COMMODITY 4053900012
20 WEIGHT 55 GALLON DRUM, NON-DETERGENT, DYNAPLEX #DTN 10000004944

COMMODITY 0550000010
TRANSMISSION FLUID, MEETING OEM SPECIFICATIONS FOR LATEST DEXRON AND MERCON
RATINGS, 55 GAL DRUM, MEDALLION PLUS #MEDI10000004752

COMMODITY 0550000027
DIESEL EXHAUST 55 GAL DRUM, 10W30 FLUID (DEF) MUSKET, #DYNDEF55

COMMODITY 0550000033

55 GAL DRUM 10W30 DIESEL HEAVY DUTY ENGINE OIL DRYDENE, MFR DYNAPLEX, #DYN1000010961

$2,239/DRUM

$305.00/DRUM

$349.00/DRUM

$324.00/DRUM

$324.00/DRUM

$324.00/DRUM

$359.00/DRUM

$275.00/DRUM

$290.90/DRUM

$278.98/DRUM

$1052.290/DRUM

$445.71/DRUM

$278.98/DRUM

$319.40/DRUM

$403.55/DRUM

$149.44/DRUM

$448.61/DRUM



COMMODITY 0550000038
OIL, MOTOR, MULTI-GRADED, 0W/20, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY,
HIGH DETERGENT, TANK/BULK MFR MEDALLION PLUS, #MEDI10000007774

COMMODITY 0550000039

OIL, MOTOR, MULTI-GRADED, 5W/30, GASOLINE ENGINE ONLY,
HIGH DETERGENT, TANK/BULK MFR MEDALLION PLUS, #MED100000014486

RELADYNE NORTHEAST

COMMODITY 0550000029

ANTIFREEZE/ENGINE COOLANT, 50/50 UNIVERSAL WITH CORE GUARD, GUARANTEED FOR ALL VEHICLES

{EUROPEAN, ASIAN, AMERICAN) WITH GASOLINE ENGINES. DURAMAX SVCCOMP50/50D

COMMODITY 0550000040
WINDSHIELD FLUID DRUM (ANTIFREEZE SOLVENT) PREMIXED MFR SPLASH #SPLWWD

FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OILS IN 55 GALLON DRUMS

PETROCHOICE

COMMODITY 4059000002
| FULLY SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL 0W40, MOBIL #XOM 105623

COMMODITY 4059000008
SYNTHETIC DIESEL OIL DELVAC 15W40, 55 GAL DRUM, MFR. MOBIL #XOM 22445

RELADYNE NORTHEAST

COMMODITY 4059000004
MOTOR OIL, 5W30, 55-GAL DRUM, FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, MFR. KENDALL # 1086956

COMMODITY 4059000005
MOTOR OIL, 10W30, 55-GAL DRUMS, SYNTHETICMOTOR OIL, MOBIL, #X0M 124396

COMMODITY. 4059000001
MOTOR OIL, 5W20, 55-GALLON DRUMS, FULL SYNTHETIC, KENDALL, #TOSGHSYN5SW20D

COMMODITY 4059000009
MOTOR OIL, W20, 55-GAL DRUM, SYNTHETIC MFR KENDALL #1086406

COMMODITY 4059000006
TRANSMISSION FLUID, FULLY SYNTHETIC MULTI VEHICLE BLEND TRANSMISSION FLUID
55 GAL DRUM, MULTI-VEHICLE, MFR. KENDALL #TOSVERD

COMMODITY 40590000067
MOTOR OIL, DELVAC 5W40, FULLY SYNTHETIC DIESEL OIL
55 GAL DRUM, MULTI-VEHICLE, MFR. KENDALL #TOSKENSHP3W4(D

NO BIDS
COMMODITY 0550000003
CAR WASH LIQUID, 1- GALLON CONTAINERS,
COMMODITY 0550000023
WHITE LITHIUM GREASE, GUNK L6-66 SERVICE PRO, 16 OZ CAN 12/CS
COMMODITY 055000034
R-1234YF REFRIGERANT HONEY WELL SEALED SOLTICE 10 LB CAN
COMMODITY 0550000022
ANTI SEIZE LUBRICANT, 8 OZ BRUSH TOP BOTTLE, PERMATEX #09128 6/CS

$6.86/GAL

$6.98/GAL

$198.00/DRUM

$140.25/DRUM

$1187.74/DRUM

$929.1 I/'DRUM

$670.45/DRUM

$571.454/DRUM

$774.95/DRUM

$824.45/DRUM

$859.00/DRUM

$1093.00/DRUM



