



**Department of Finance**  
Bureau of Purchase & Supplies  
148 Martine Ave., Room 713  
White Plains, N.Y. 10601  
(914) 231-1872  
[www.westchestergov.com](http://www.westchestergov.com)

### CONTRACT EXTENSION AWARD NOTIFICATION

TITLE	Radios, Vehicle Warning Lights, Sirens, Related Devices, Install, Remove, Configure, Repair and Maintain
CONTRACT NUMBER	5616 BPS, 5617 BPS, 5618 BPS, 5619 BPS, 5620 BPS
CONTRACT PERIOD	Dec. 1, 2017 to Nov. 30, 2018
DATE OF ISSUE	OCT 19, 2017
COUNTY CONSUMER(S)	DES, DOC, DPW, PRC, Pub. Safety, Part. Municipalities

The referenced contracts have been extended for another year at the prices attached. Other terms and conditions remain unchanged.

#### Address Inquiries To:

COUNTY DEPARTMENTS	POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS
Name : Marc Goldenberg Title : Senior Buyer Phone : 914-231-1427 Fax : 914-231-1546 E-mail: <a href="mailto:meg5@westchestergov.com">meg5@westchestergov.com</a>	Customer Service contact: Name : Dianne Munro Phone : 914-231-1315 Fax : 914-231-1546 E-mail: <a href="mailto:dmm6@westchestergov.com">dmm6@westchestergov.com</a>

Award Notice  
Contracts 5616 to 5620 BPS  
Page 2

Contract 5616 BPS  
Vendor #701025  
ESS Inc.  
250 Clearbrook Road  
Elmsford, NY 10523  
Att: Pam Coltrane-Knott

Tel: 914-592-5005  
Terms: 2% 10, Net 30  
FOB: Destination  
Delivery: within 10 days

Awarded Bid Sections:  
Radio Equipment  
Vehicle Warning Lights etc.  
Fixed Rate Radio Repairs

Contract 5618 BPS  
Vendor #971078  
Metrocom Wireless  
31 Plainfield Ave.  
Bedford Hills, NY 10507  
Att: Kevin Ronald

Tel: 914-244-3500  
Terms: 2% 10, Net 30  
FOB: Destination  
Delivery: within 10 days

Awarded Bid Sections:  
Radio Equipment

Contract 5620 BPS  
Vendor #734918  
New York Communications Co., Inc.  
53 West Cedar St.  
Poughkeepsie, NY 12601  
Att: Jenna Riess

Tel: 845-471-5520  
Terms: 2% 10, Net 30  
FOB: Destination

Contract 5617 BPS  
Vendor #932636  
TCD Cellular Communications Inc. (The Cruisers Div.)  
420 Mount Pleasant Ave.  
Mamaroneck, NY 10543  
Att: Gary Gerstein

Tel: 914-381-7700  
Terms: Net 30  
FOB: Destination  
Delivery: within 10 days

Awarded Bid Section:  
Vehicle Warning Lights etc.

Contract 5619 BPS  
Vendor #727254  
Goosetown Communications  
58 North Harrison Ave.  
Congers, NY 10920  
Att: David Gottlieb

Tel: 845-268-7500  
Terms: Net 30  
FOB: Destination  
Delivery: within 7 days

Awarded Bid Sections:  
Radio Equipment  
Vehicle Warning Lights etc.  
Fixed Rate Radio Repairs

New York Communications Co., Inc., continued  
Delivery: within 10 days

Awarded Bid Sections:  
Radio Equipment  
Vehicle Warning Lights etc.  
Fixed Rate Radio Repairs

<u>Section One, Radio Equipment</u>	<u>ESS</u>	<u>Goosetown</u>	<u>Metrocom</u>	<u>NY Comm</u>	<u>TCD Cellular</u>
Dash Mount Radio Install (incl. antenna)	\$ 157.50	\$ 270.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 294.00	no bid
Trunk Mount Radio Install ("	\$ 183.75	\$ 405.00	\$ 240.00	\$ 399.00	no bid
Console/Control Station Install	\$ 231.00	\$ 220.50	\$ 160.00	\$ 205.00	no bid
Install portable radios, chargers	\$ 115.50	\$ 141.75	\$ 80.00	\$ 100.00	no bid
Remove Dash Mount Radio	\$ 57.75	\$ 141.75	\$ 40.00	\$ 130.00	no bid
Remove Trunk Mount Radio	\$ 78.75	\$ 212.10	\$ 40.00	\$ 195.00	no bid
Remove Console	\$ 115.50	\$ 67.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 47.00	no bid
Remove Portables	\$ 57.75	\$ 67.50	\$ 40.00	\$ 47.00	no bid
Lowband Antenna Kit	\$ 102.00	\$ 110.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 85.00	no bid
VHF Antenna, ¼ wave	\$ 71.24	\$ 95.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 85.00	no bid
UHF Antenna, ¼ wave	\$ 44.85	\$ 95.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 85.00	no bid
VHF or UHF Gain Antenna	\$ 60.50	\$ 95.00	\$ 95.00	\$21.5 to 27.	no bid
Power Dist. Kit 12 volt DC	\$ 95.00	\$ 135.00	no bid	\$ 129.00	no bid
Programming for portables	\$ 110.00	\$ 141.75	\$ 31.00	\$ 49.00	no bid
Program mobile radios in veh. & bench P/HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 141.75	\$ 40.00	\$ 39.00	no bid
Labor 8 AM to 4 PM, M-F	\$ 110.00	\$ 141.75	\$ 110.00	\$ 115.00	no bid
Labor nights, weekends, holidays	\$ 165.00	\$ 212.10	\$ 187.50	\$ 172.50	no bid
Labor, Out of Warranty Repairs	\$ 50.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 67.00	no bid
Flat rate repair CDM mobiles	\$ 299.25	\$ 298.20	\$ 284.00	\$ 279.00	no bid
Flat rate repair XTS, XTL, MCS	\$ 409.50	\$ 488.25	\$ 399.00	\$ 193.00	no bid
% markup, other items	25%	25%	15%	22.90%	no bid

<u>Section Two, Vehicle Warning Lights etc.</u>	<u>ESS</u>	<u>Goosetown</u>	<u>Metrocom</u>	<u>NY Comm</u>	<u>TCD Cellular</u>
Install roof rack (light bar, siren, spkr, switch)	\$ 635.04	\$ 920.00	no bid	\$ 835.00	\$ 630.00
Install siren and speaker	\$ 338.47	\$ 425.00	no bid	\$ 415.00	\$ 262.50
Install grill lights (halogen or LED)	\$ 105.00	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 105.00	\$ 210.00
Install wig-wags or halogen inserts	\$ 105.00	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 105.00	\$ 105.00
Install port strobe power supply-4	\$ 423.36	\$ 425.00	no bid	\$ 415.00	\$ 420.00
Install port strobe power supply-8	\$ 621.81	\$ 540.00	no bid	\$ 525.00	\$ 630.00
Install dash light	\$ 105.00	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 95.00	\$ 105.00
Install mirror strobes or LED's	\$ 157.50	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 210.00	\$ 210.00
Remove roof rack	\$ 210.00	\$ 425.00	no bid	\$ 310.00	\$ 262.50
Remove siren and speaker	\$ 105.00	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 157.50
Remove Grill lights	\$ 52.50	\$ 70.00	no bid	\$ 49.00	\$ 105.00
Remove wig-wags or halogen inserts	\$ 52.50	\$ 70.00	no bid	\$ 49.00	\$ 78.75
Remove port strobe power supply-4	\$ 105.00	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 100.00	\$ 157.50
Remove port strobe power supply-8	\$ 157.50	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 157.00	\$ 262.50
Remove mirror strobes of LED's	\$ 52.50	\$ 70.00	no bid	\$ 49.00	\$ 157.50
Remove dash light	\$ 52.50	\$ 70.00	no bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 52.50
Labor 8 AM to 4 PM, M-F	\$ 115.50	\$ 141.75	no bid	\$ 105.00	\$ 99.75
Labor nights, weekends, holidays P/HR	\$ 173.25	\$ 212.10	no bid	\$ 157.00	\$ 189.00
% markup, other items	25%	25%	no bid	22.90%	15%

Additional Flat Rate Repairs:

	<u>ESS</u>	<u>Goosetown</u>	<u>Metrocom</u>	<u>NY Comm</u>	<u>TCD Cellular</u>
Motorola MT 1500	\$ 409.50	\$ 412.65	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Motorola HT 1000	\$ 299.25	na	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Motorola XTS 5000	\$ 409.50	\$ 412.65	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Motorola XTL 5000	\$ 488.25	\$ 645.75	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Motorola HT 750	\$ 299.25	\$ 298.20	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Motorola Minitor III, IV, V	\$ 136.50	\$ 110.25	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
Kenwood 90 Series	\$ 231.00	\$ 309.75	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid
ICOM IC F-60	\$ 157.50	\$ 210.00	no bid	\$95/hr	no bid

Added Items for the contracts:

Install laptop (includes mount install)	\$ 262.50	\$ 425.25	\$ 255.00	105/hr	\$ 180.00
Install GPS unit	\$ 157.50	no bid	\$ 170.00	105/hr	\$ 95.00
Install GPS unit with rear view camera	hrly rate	no bid	no bid	105/hr	\$ 180.00